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HEAVEN RIDE is a techno-thriller about two loyal friends who unlock secrets of the human soul and invent
a device that ejects the soul and long-term memory on its path to heaven, and then brings it back. The “Pod”
enables them to build Heaven Ride into the most lucrative empire the world has ever known, until ruthless
rivals embark on a campaign of deceit, treachery and betrayal to wrest it away for their own insidious plan.
This quandary of science and morality may change the way you think about heaven and the afterlife …
FOREVER. * * * David Brownington, a brilliant entrepreneurial mastermind with a leading business
incubator, comes in contact with a mysterious gadget that measures wavelengths never seen before. His close
friend, JW Gomez, a third-year Ph.D. candidate, supercedes the boundaries of his doctoral studies using a
bio-pod that creates out-of-body experiences. Driven by memories of his little brother who perished in a
gruesome accident as a child, JW's extra-curricular studies of sudden traumatic death lead to the astonishing
discovery of the human soul. When David and JW merge these devices, they stumble upon the highway to
heaven. Each of them falls in love as their miraculous invention takes the world by storm. Millions make the
trip. As Heaven Ride prospers, its repercussions ripple throughout society. Protests, bombs and kidnappings
threaten to shut it down, posing risks to David, JW, their friends and families. Long after Heaven Ride
becomes a household word, startling revelations put David and JW in the crosshairs of dangerous men
seeking ultimate power. With HEAVEN RIDE, John Eccleston and Kerry Gleason have woven an intense
tale of ambition, success, friendship, betrayal, greed and corruption. It's an intricate and interesting tale of
mankind's most startling invention, and technology gone awry.
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Jackson:

Heaven Ride (Heaven RIde Trilogy) (Volume 1) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of
us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary which could increase your
knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The author
giving his/her effort that will put every word into joy arrangement in writing Heaven Ride (Heaven RIde
Trilogy) (Volume 1) although doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and also based
confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can drawn you into
brand-new stage of crucial thinking.

Christina Love:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since
fantastic as in the outside search likes. Maybe you answer can be Heaven Ride (Heaven RIde Trilogy)
(Volume 1) why because the great cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint a
person. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will
directly guide you to pick up this book.

Raymond Littlefield:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This book Heaven Ride (Heaven RIde Trilogy) (Volume 1) was filled regarding science.
Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several feel
when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can really feel
enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.

Dolores Rawson:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart and soul or real
their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful images
on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this
time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Heaven Ride (Heaven RIde Trilogy) (Volume 1) can make you truly feel more interested to
read.
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