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The year is 2250, and it has been six months since James Kirk joined Starfleet Academy. A rebellious young
man, Kirk is used to doing things his way--and whenever he feels like it. However, the Academy is changing
him little by little, showing him how to transform his headstrong attitude and ambition into qualities that
make him a leader. Kirk's behavior often brings him to clash with another Starfleet Academy member, a
half-Vulcan, half-human named Spock. This book series will delve into the lives and relationships of Kirk
and the other recruits at the Academy, their training, their missions, and their romances.

In The Delta Anomaly, a shocking San Francisco crime shakes up Starfleet Academy, entangling Kirk,
McCoy, Uhura, and Spock…. and turns out to have chilling intergalactic implications.
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From reader reviews:

Ellen Wirth:

This book untitled The Delta Anomaly (Star Trek: Starfleet Academy Book 1) to be one of several books
that will best seller in this year, this is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it.
You will easily to buy this book in the book store or you can order it by way of online. The publisher on this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your
Cell phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.

Myrtle Anderson:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Delta Anomaly (Star Trek: Starfleet
Academy Book 1), you may enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading
friends.

Wilson Gonzalez:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find
publication that need more time to be go through. The Delta Anomaly (Star Trek: Starfleet Academy Book
1) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you who have those short time problems.

Violet Murray:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Delta Anomaly (Star Trek: Starfleet
Academy Book 1) can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your spare time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books
have than the others?
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