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In his gripping and provocative debut, anthropologist Jason De León sheds light on one of the most pressing
political issues of our time—the human consequences of US immigration policy.  The Land of Open Graves
reveals the suffering and deaths that occur daily in the Sonoran Desert of Arizona as thousands of
undocumented migrants attempt to cross the border from Mexico into the United States.

Drawing on the four major fields of anthropology, De León uses an innovative combination of ethnography,
archaeology, linguistics, and forensic science to produce a scathing critique of “Prevention through
Deterrence,” the federal border enforcement policy that encourages migrants to cross in areas characterized
by extreme environmental conditions and high risk of death. For two decades, this policy has failed to deter
border crossers while successfully turning the rugged terrain of southern Arizona into a killing field.

In harrowing detail, De León chronicles the journeys of people who have made dozens of attempts to cross
the border and uncovers the stories of the objects and bodies left behind in the desert.

The Land of Open Graves will spark debate and controversy.
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From reader reviews:

Johanna Hernandez:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book The Land of Open Graves: Living and Dying on
the Migrant Trail (California Series in Public Anthropology). You can choose the best book if you like
reading a book. So long as we know about how is important any book The Land of Open Graves: Living and
Dying on the Migrant Trail (California Series in Public Anthropology). You can add knowledge and of
course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can realize
everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple issue
until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book or perhaps searching by internet
system. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's study.

France Brown:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer can be The Land of Open Graves: Living and Dying on the Migrant Trail
(California Series in Public Anthropology) why because the great cover that make you consider about the
content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover.
Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Willie McCorkle:

That book can make you to feel relax. This specific book The Land of Open Graves: Living and Dying on
the Migrant Trail (California Series in Public Anthropology) was vibrant and of course has pictures on the
website. As we know that book The Land of Open Graves: Living and Dying on the Migrant Trail
(California Series in Public Anthropology) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until teenagers. For
example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore ,
not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the
best book for you personally and try to like reading that will.

Robert Polk:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source that filled
update of news. Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an
individual. From media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book,
fresh and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread
out your book? Or just trying to find the The Land of Open Graves: Living and Dying on the Migrant Trail
(California Series in Public Anthropology) when you desired it?
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