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This dictionary contains the vocabulary of office automation software programs for micro-computers. The
subfields covered are: word processing; desktop publishing; database and file management systems; decision
support systems; spreadsheets and graphers; messaging systems; videotex.

The terminology compiled is used in the manuals of popular software packages and in articles of specialized
journals on micro-computing. Consequently, for programming, data processing, editing, statistics or
planning, only the terms currently found in this body of literature are kept. However, collocations have been
included because they are useful for translators and cannot always be separated from proper terms.
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From reader reviews:

Philip Mejia:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve Elsevier's Dictionary of Office
Automation: In English (with definitions), French, German and Dutch (Elsevier Dictionaries on CD-ROM)
will make you to become smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about every thing.
But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make you fun.
Why they may be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or appropriate book with you?

Elsie Hawkins:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can
certainly share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader
with their story or even their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write
about the data about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve
their expertise in writing, they also doing some study before they write for their book. One of them is this
Elsevier's Dictionary of Office Automation: In English (with definitions), French, German and Dutch
(Elsevier Dictionaries on CD-ROM).

Christine Cote:

A lot of book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top book
for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is called of book Elsevier's Dictionary of
Office Automation: In English (with definitions), French, German and Dutch (Elsevier Dictionaries on CD-
ROM). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could possibly
add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about reserve. It
can bring you from one spot to other place.

Joyce Jiminez:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
a book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
trying to find the Elsevier's Dictionary of Office Automation: In English (with definitions), French, German



and Dutch (Elsevier Dictionaries on CD-ROM) when you required it?
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