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Mastering R has never been easier

Picking up R can be tough, even for seasoned statisticians and data analysts. R For Dummies, 2nd Edition
provides a quick and painless way to master all the R you'll ever need. Requiring no prior programming
experience and packed with tons of practical examples, step-by-step exercises, and sample code, this friendly
and accessible guide shows you how to know your way around lists, data frames, and other R data structures,
while learning to interact with other programs, such as Microsoft Excel. You'll learn how to reshape and
manipulate data, merge data sets, split and combine data, perform calculations on vectors and arrays, and so
much more.

R is an open source statistical environment and programming language that has become very popular in
varied fields for the management and analysis of data. R provides a wide array of statistical and graphical
techniques, and has become the standard among statisticians for software development and data analysis. R
For Dummies, 2nd Edition takes the intimidation out of working with R and arms you with the knowledge and
know-how to master the programming language of choice among statisticians and data analysts worldwide.

Covers downloading, installing, and configuring R●

Includes tips for getting data in and out of R●

Offers advice on fitting regression models and ANOVA●

Provides helpful hints for working with graphics●

R For Dummies, 2nd Edition is an ideal introduction to R for complete beginners, as well as an excellent
technical reference for experienced R programmers.
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From reader reviews:

Donovan Houseman:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
habit give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of
e-book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel happy
read one using theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual R For Dummies is kind of
reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Kerry Maye:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, along with
soon. The R For Dummies provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Patrick Bodin:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This R For Dummies can be the response,
oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Larisa Nagle:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book R For Dummies to make your own reading is
interesting. Your personal skill of reading talent is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very
simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the sensation about book and reading especially. It is
to be initial opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside that the e-book R For Dummies can to
be your friend when you're feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of this time.
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