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Taking a leap and making the choice to start a business can be hard, but all that comes after—the planning,
loans, marketing—can be even harder. Every new business owner needs an easy, clear, and useful guide to
follow when embarking on this venture, and Minding My Business will make the process as simple as
possible.

With no previous business experience, Adeena Mignogna decided to open up her own retail store, a paint-
your-own pottery studio. In this part memoir, part handbook, she details all the things she did right, and
wrong, so that anyone following in her footsteps won’t make the same mistakes. Minding My Business
explains how to:

Deal with leasing and landlords●

Obtain loans and manage finances●

Hire, retain, and treat employees●

Market and advertise your business●

Deal with stressful situations●

Create an exit strategy if you decide to close●

Sell your business●

And everything in between●

Mignogna chronicles all that went into opening the doors to her store, successfully managing it for several
years, and then finally deciding to close it. If you’re ready to take the risk, you’ll need this book to help you
navigate through the tough and perplexing world of small business.
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Chambers:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Minding My Business: The Complete, No-
Nonsense, Start-to-Finish Guide to Owning and Running Your Own Store will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think this
open or reading the book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they may be thought like
that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Emma Englund:

Why? Because this Minding My Business: The Complete, No-Nonsense, Start-to-Finish Guide to Owning
and Running Your Own Store is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this
but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author
who have write the book in such remarkable way makes the content interior easier to understand,
entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating
having this ever again or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of advantages than the
other book get such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking method. So , still want to
hold up having that book? If I were being you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Michael Green:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of Minding My Business: The Complete, No-Nonsense,
Start-to-Finish Guide to Owning and Running Your Own Store can give you a lot of good friends because by
you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting
person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This publication offer you information
that might be your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than additional make you to be great individuals.
So , why hesitate? We need to have Minding My Business: The Complete, No-Nonsense, Start-to-Finish
Guide to Owning and Running Your Own Store.

Wayne Queen:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen want book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By
book Minding My Business: The Complete, No-Nonsense, Start-to-Finish Guide to Owning and Running
Your Own Store we can have more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? Being creative person
must want to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't always be



doubt to change your life at this time book Minding My Business: The Complete, No-Nonsense, Start-to-
Finish Guide to Owning and Running Your Own Store. You can more appealing than now.
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