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Dispelling the myth that women became involved in partisan politics only after they obtained the vote, this
study uses contemporary newspaper sources to show that women were active in the party struggle long
before 1920. Although their role was initially limited to attending rallies and hosting picnics, they gradually
began to use their pens and voices to support party tickets. By the late 19th century, women spoke at party
functions and organized all-female groups to help canvass neighborhoods and get out the vote. In the early
suffrage states of the West, they voted in increasing numbers and even held a few offices.

Women were particularly active, this book shows, in the minor reformist parties?Populist, Prohibitionist,
Socialist, and Progressive?but eventually came to play a role in the major parties as well. Prominent suffrage
leaders, such as Elizabeth Cady Stanton and Susan B. Anthony, entered the partisan arena in order to
promote their cause. By the time the suffrage amendment was ratified, women were deeply involved in the
mainstream political process.
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From reader reviews:

Arlene Oliver:

The book Before Equal Suffrage: Women in Partisan Politics from Colonial Times to 1920 (Contributions in
Women's Studies) will bring you to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to
elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book you just read, this book very suitable to
you. The book Before Equal Suffrage: Women in Partisan Politics from Colonial Times to 1920
(Contributions in Women's Studies) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book
through the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

John Martindale:

Beside this particular Before Equal Suffrage: Women in Partisan Politics from Colonial Times to 1920
(Contributions in Women's Studies) in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from the oven so
don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have
Before Equal Suffrage: Women in Partisan Politics from Colonial Times to 1920 (Contributions in Women's
Studies) because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you occasionally have book but
you do not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this inside
your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you
still want to miss that? Find this book in addition to read it from now!

Rebbecca Farley:

This Before Equal Suffrage: Women in Partisan Politics from Colonial Times to 1920 (Contributions in
Women's Studies) is completely new way for you who has attention to look for some information given it
relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know otherwise
you who still having bit of digest in reading this Before Equal Suffrage: Women in Partisan Politics from
Colonial Times to 1920 (Contributions in Women's Studies) can be the light food for yourself because the
information inside this specific book is easy to get by anyone. These books produce itself in the form and
that is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in guide form make
them feel tired even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a guide especially
this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss this! Just read
this e-book variety for your better life and also knowledge.

Tanya Wilson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you know
that little person like reading or as examining become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your



own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something by book.
Numerous books that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims Before Equal Suffrage:
Women in Partisan Politics from Colonial Times to 1920 (Contributions in Women's Studies).
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