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Culture and history can be passed from one generation to the next through the food we eat, the vegetables
and fruits we plant and harvest, and the fragrant flowers and herbs that enliven our gardens. The plants our
ancestors grew tell stories about their way of life.

 

Wisconsin’s nineteenth-century settlers arrived in the New World in search of new opportunities and the
chance to create a new life. These European immigrants and Yankee settlers brought their traditional
foodways with them—their family recipes and the seeds, roots, and slips of cherished plants—to serve as
comfort food, in the truest sense. 

 

This part of our collective history comes alive at Old World Wisconsin’s re-created nineteenth-century
heirloom gardens. In Putting Down Roots, historical gardener Marcia C. Carmichael guides us through these
gardens, sharing insights on why the owners of the original houses—be they Yankee settlers, German,
Norwegian, Irish, Danish, Polish, or Finnish immigrants—planted and harvested what they did. She shares
timeless lessons with today’s gardeners and cooks about planting trends and practices, garden tools used by
early settlers, popular plant varieties, and favorite flavors of Wisconsin’s early settlers, including recipes for
such classics as Irish soda bread, pierogi, and Norwegian rhubarb custard.

 

Putting Down Roots celebrates the diversity and rich ethnic settlement of Wisconsin. It’s also a story of
holding fast to one’s traditions and adapting to new ways that nourished one’s family so they could flourish
in their new surroundings.
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From reader reviews:

Eunice Buckley:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What did
you do? Everybody has many questions above. They must answer that question due to the fact just their can
do that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from on
guardería until university need this specific Putting Down Roots: Gardening Insights from Wisconsin's Early
Settlers to read.

Dave Edwards:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Putting Down Roots:
Gardening Insights from Wisconsin's Early Settlers book since this book offers you rich facts and
knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you
probably know this.

Linda Manning:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get a lot
of information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with
their story or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
the knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write for their book. One of them is this Putting
Down Roots: Gardening Insights from Wisconsin's Early Settlers.

Delores Saenz:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the
best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is referred to as of
book Putting Down Roots: Gardening Insights from Wisconsin's Early Settlers. You can include your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a person happier
to read. It is most important that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other
place.
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