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Weber and Durkheim: A methodological comparison is a systematic, comparative analysis of the
methodologies of Max Weber and Émile Durkheim. Jensen shows how Weber and Durkheim analyse
Protestants and Catholics in practice in The Protestant Ethic and Suicide, respectively. The very different
ways that Weber and Durkheim carry out their analyses are then used to describe, analyse and contrast their
methodological principles and points of view, raising fundamental questions in sociological and social
science analysis, such as:

What constitutes the object of sociology?●

How are concepts developed?●

What status can be attributed to laws?●

Which possibilities – and limitations – do we have for producing scientific insight into society?●

What are we to think of the relationship between ‘Is’ and ‘Ought’ – and how can social science deal with●

values?
How are social phenomena to be explained?●

This book will be a valuable resource for students and scholars of sociology, social methodology, political
theory, political science, social theory and philosophy.
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From reader reviews:

Nellie Nelson:

This Weber and Durkheim: A Methodological Comparison are generally reliable for you who want to
certainly be a successful person, why. The reason why of this Weber and Durkheim: A Methodological
Comparison can be one of many great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple
looking at food but feed a person with information that maybe will shock your before knowledge. This book
is actually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed kinds.
Beside that this Weber and Durkheim: A Methodological Comparison giving you an enormous of experience
such as rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day pastime. So ,
let's have it appreciate reading.

Ruby Harris:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or
their own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to
fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free
time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the guide untitled Weber and Durkheim: A Methodological Comparison can
be great book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Audrey Patton:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all
day long to reading a book. The book Weber and Durkheim: A Methodological Comparison it is rather good
to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When
you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore very easily
to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book possesses high quality.

Ana Jimenez:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Weber and Durkheim: A Methodological
Comparison can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date,
spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides
have than the others?
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