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Discusses the two most important figures in early Jewish mythologies of evil, the fallen angels Azazel and
Satanael.

Dark Mirrors is a wide-ranging study of two central figures in early Jewish demonology—the fallen angels
Azazel and Satanael. Andrei A. Orlov explores the mediating role of these paradigmatic celestial rebels in
the development of Jewish demonological traditions from Second Temple apocalypticism to later Jewish
mysticism, such as that of the Hekhalot and Shi'ur Qomah materials. Throughout, Orlov makes use of Jewish
pseudepigraphical materials in Slavonic that are not widely known.

Orlov traces the origins of Azazel and Satanael to different and competing mythologies of evil, one to the
Fall in the Garden of Eden, the other to the revolt of angels in the antediluvian period. Although Azazel and
Satanael are initially representatives of rival etiologies of corruption, in later Jewish and Christian
demonological lore each is able to enter the other’s stories in new conceptual capacities. Dark Mirrors also
examines the symmetrical patterns of early Jewish demonology that are often manifested in these fallen
angels’ imitation of the attributes of various heavenly beings, including principal angels and even God
himself.

“…an engaging examination of the two most infamous characters of Second Temple Jewish demonology, the
fallen angels Satan and Azazel … Dark Mirrors will be of interest to students of the scriptures and especially
those interested in religious history, whether or not they have prior experience with the early Jewish and
early Christian texts he utilizes. The many parallels with LDS understandings of the nature of Satan should
be apparent and exciting for most. Orlov is one of the foremost scholars on this genre of extrabiblical texts
and much can be gleaned from his adventurous and insightful approach.” — BYU Studies Quarterly

“Orlov has succeeded in producing a well-written and closely argued account that will serve as a fine
resource in early Jewish and Christian literature for years to come.” — H-Net Reviews, H-Judaic

“Andrei Orlov [has] made a name for himself in the academic world by studying rarely examined Jewish
pseudo-epigraphic works that have come down to us in Slavonic … Recommended for academic
collections.” — Association of Jewish Libraries Reviews

Andrei A. Orlov is Associate Professor of Theology at Marquette University. He is the author of several
books, including Selected Studies in the Slavonic Pseudepigrapha.
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Ruff:

As people who live in often the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or info even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an individual is
you don't know what one you should start with. This Dark Mirrors: Azazel and Satanael in Early Jewish
Demonology is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you
want and want in this era.

Erica Dennis:

Beside that Dark Mirrors: Azazel and Satanael in Early Jewish Demonology in your phone, it could give you
a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got here
is fresh from the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow commune. It is
good thing to have Dark Mirrors: Azazel and Satanael in Early Jewish Demonology because this book offers
to you personally readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's all
about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot
be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this book as well
as read it from currently!

William Davis:

You can find this Dark Mirrors: Azazel and Satanael in Early Jewish Demonology by visit the bookstore or
Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the knowledge.
Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by simply written or printed but can you enjoy this book by
means of e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching
what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your book. It is
most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose correct
ways for you.

Gloria Taylor:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Dark Mirrors: Azazel and Satanael in Early Jewish
Demonology to make your own reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading proficiency is developing
when you including reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the
impression about book and reading especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book
and examine it. Beside that the book Dark Mirrors: Azazel and Satanael in Early Jewish Demonology can to
be your brand-new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of
these time.
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