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Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com is neither a tutorial nor a book for
beginners. Intended for developers who are already familiar with the Apex language, and experienced Java
and C# developers who are moving to Apex, this book starts where the Force.com documentation leaves off.

Instead of trying to cover all of the features of the platform, Advanced Apex programming focuses entirely
on the Apex language and core design patterns. You’ll learn how to truly think in Apex – to embrace limits
and bulk patterns. You’ll see how to develop architectures for efficient and reliable trigger handling, and for
asynchronous operations. You’ll discover that best practices differ radically depending on whether you are
building software for a specific organization or for a managed package. And you’ll find approaches for
incorporating testing and diagnostic code that can dramatically improve the reliability and deployment of
Apex software, and reduce your lifecycle and support costs.

Based on his experience as a consultant, Salesforce MVP and architect of major AppExchange packages,
Dan Appleman focuses on the real-world problems and issues that are faced by Apex developers every day,
along with the obscure problems and surprises that can sneak up on you if you are unprepared.

This third edition contains updates through Summer 15 (API 34) along with significant new content on
asynchronous design patterns, optimization and maintaining Apex applications.
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From reader reviews:

Yvonne Terrell:

This Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com book is not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is usually information
inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper a person read a lot of
information you will get. This specific Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com
without we recognize teach the one who examining it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't
possibly be worry Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com can bring whenever you
are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in your lovely
laptop even cell phone. This Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com having good
arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Carmen Jensen:

The publication untitled Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com is the guide that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a person.
The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer
was did a lot of analysis when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com
from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Evelyn Garcia:

The book untitled Advanced Apex Programming for Salesforce.com and Force.com contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains your ex idea with easy way. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled
by famous author. The author gives you in the new age of literary works. You can read this book because
you can please read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site as well as
order it. Have a nice go through.

Nola Schroeder:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Advanced Apex Programming for
Salesforce.com and Force.com can be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out
of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
textbooks have than the others?
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